
INDATA CORPORATION 
ELECTRONIC END USER LICENSE AGREEMENT FOR DEPOVIEW SOFTWARE 
 
NOTICE TO USER: This End-User License Agreement ("EULA") is a legal agreement between you 
(either an individual or a single entity) and inData Corporation ("INDATA") for the INDATA software 
product identified above, and any and all enhancements, derivatives, updates, "online" or electronic 
documentation and supplements (hereinafter "SOFTWARE PRODUCT") provided to you by INDATA or 
INDATA's resellers. By installing copying, downloading, accessing or otherwise using the SOFTWARE 
PRODUCT, you agree to be bound by the terms of this EULA. If you do not agree to the terms of this 
EULA, do not install or use the SOFTWARE PRODUCT; you may, however, return the package to your 
place of purchase within 30 days of the purchase date for a full refund.  SOFTWARE PRODUCT as 
provided herein does not refer to source code, and no license is granted with respect to source code of 
any kind. Copyright and all other rights in the SOFTWARE PRODUCT shall remain with INDATA. 
 
PRODUCT LICENSE 
The PRODUCT is protected by copyright laws and international copyright treaties, as well as other 
intellectual property laws and treaties.  The SOFTWARE PRODUCT is licensed not sold. 
 
1. GRANT OF LICENSE.  This EULA grants to you the non-exclusive rights to install, use and distribute 
an unlimited number of copies of the SOFTWARE PRODUCT solely for the purpose reviewing and 
presenting data that has been exported from the software application known as TimecoderPro™.  The 
SOFTWARE PRODUCT is intended to be distributed via internet download or on physical medium 
separate from any medium containing data to be viewed using the SOFTWARE PRODUCT.  Any other 
use of the SOFTWARE PRODUCT without written authorization from INDATA is strictly prohibited by this 
EULA. 
 
2. COPYRIGHT 
(a) Software: All title and intellectual property rights in and to SOFTWARE PRODUCT (including but not 
limited to any images, photographs, animations, video, audio, music, text, and "applets" incorporated into 
the SOFTWARE PRODUCT ), the accompanying printed materials, and any copies of the SOFTWARE 
PRODUCT are owned by INDATA or its suppliers. 
(b) Documentation: You are granted limited right to duplicate the documentation included with network 
versions of the SOFTWARE PRODUCT for the purpose of providing licensed users with reference 
materials.  This authorization to duplicate documentation does not extend to the other elements of the 
SOFTWARE PRODUCT. This authorization to duplicate documentation may be transferred only in 
accordance with the Transfer provisions specified in the Agreement. 
 
3. TRANSFER AND OTHER RESTRICTIONS 
You may transfer this License to another person ("ASSIGNEE"), but only if (1) you give all of the software 
(including all back-up copies) and documentation to the other person; and (2) the other person sends 
INDATA their name, address, written assignment from you and a written statement from the ASSIGNEE 
stating that the ASSIGNEE understands and agrees to the terms of this license agreement. When you 
transfer this license, your right to use the software and documentation ends, and you must destroy or 
remove all copies of the SOFTWARE PRODUCT in your possession. 
 
You agree not to: (1) use the SOFTWARE PRODUCT or make copies of it except as permitted in this 
License; (2) publish or distribute the computer images, sound files, or fonts included with the SOFTWARE 
PRODUCT as computer images, sound files or fonts; (3) use any of the computer images related to 
identifiable individuals or entities in a manner which suggests their association with or endorsement of 
any product or service; (4) translate, reverse engineer, decompile or disassemble the SOFTWARE 
PRODUCT; (5) rent, lease, assign or transfer the SOFTWARE PRODUCT except as set out above; (6) 
modify the SOFTWARE PRODUCT or merge all or any part of the SOFTWARE PRODUCT in another 
program or derivative work. 
 
4. LIMITED WARRANTY 
INDATA warrants that the storage media in which this SOFTWARE PRODUCT is embedded will be free 



from defects in materials and workmanship for 90 days from the date you acquire it.  If such a defect 
occurs during the warranty period, return it to INDATA at the address below with a copy of your receipt 
and a description of the defect in sufficient detail so as to allow us to reproduce the defect, and INDATA 
will repair or replace it (our option which) for free.  This remedy is your exclusive remedy and our sole 
obligation for breach of this warranty.  Any misuse or unauthorized modification of the SOFTWARE will 
void this limited warranty.  No person, dealer or company may expand or alter this warranty.  It gives you 
certain rights and you may have other legislated rights which vary from jurisdiction to jurisdiction. 
 
5. LIMITATION OF WARRANTIES AND LIABILITY 
Except for the express warranty above, the SOFTWARE PRODUCT is provided on an "as is" basis, 
without any other warranties, or conditions, express or implied, including but not limited to warranties of 
merchantable quality, merchantability or fitness for a particular purpose, or those arising by law, statute, 
usage of trade or course of dealing.  Moreover, INDATA makes no warranty, representation, promise or 
guarantee, either express or implied, statutory or otherwise, with respect to the user documentation or 
related technical support.  The entire risk as to the results and performance of the SOFTWARE 
PRODUCT is assumed by you.  Because software is inherently complex and may not be completely free 
of errors, it is your responsibility to verify your work and to make backup copies. 
 
Neither INDATA nor its dealers or suppliers shall have any liability to you or any other person or entity for 
any indirect, incidental, special or consequential damages whatsoever arising out of this agreement or out 
of the software licensed hereunder, including but not limited to loss of revenue or profit, personal injury, 
injury to reputation, lost or damaged data or other commercial or economic loss, even if INDATA has 
been advised of the possibility of such damages or they are foreseeable. Neither INDATA nor its dealers 
or suppliers shall have any liability to you for claims by a third party against you for any indirect, 
incidental, special or consequential damages whatsoever arising out of this agreement or out of the 
software licensed hereunder, including but not limited to loss of revenue or profit, personal injury, injury to 
reputation, lost or damaged data or other commercial or economic loss, even if INDATA has been 
advised of the possibility of such damages or they are foreseeable. 
 
INDATA shall not have any liability to you or any other person or entity for any damages whatsoever 
arising out of alleged patent infringements against you or your customers for distribution of the 
SOFTWARE PRODUCT in a manner inconsistent with the distribution methods intended and prescribed 
by INDATA in this EULA. 
 
INDATA's maximum aggregate liability to you, and that of INDATA's dealers and suppliers, shall not 
exceed the amount paid by you for the SOFTWARE.  The limitations in this section shall apply whether or 
not the alleged breach or default is a breach of a fundamental condition or term, or a fundamental breach.  
Some states/countries do not allow the exclusion or limitation of liability for consequential or incidental 
damages so the above limitation may not apply to you. 
  
6. TERM 
The license is effective until terminated.  It will also terminate upon conditions set forth elsewhere in this 
Agreement or if you fail to comply with any term or condition of this Agreement.  You agree upon such 
termination to destroy the programs together with all copies, modifications, and merged portions in any 
form.  The Limitations of Warranties and Liability set out above shall continue in force even after any 
termination. 
 
7. U.S. GOVERNMENT RESTRICTED RIGHTS 
If this SOFTWARE is acquired by or for the U.S. Government then it is provided with Restricted Rights.  
Use, duplication, or disclosure by the U.S. Government is subject to restrictions as set forth in 
subparagraph {c}(1)(ii) of The Rights in Technical Data and Computer Software clause at DFARS 
252.227-7013, or subparagraphs {c}(1) and (2) of the Commercial Computer Software-Restricted Rights 
at 48 CFR 52.227-19, or clause 18-52.227-86(d) of the NASA Supplement to the FAR, as applicable.  
Contracter/Manufacturer is inData Corporation, 1325 N. Fiesta Blvd, Suite 4, Gilbert, Arizona, 85233. 
 
8. GOVERNING LAW AND GENERAL PROVISIONS. 



This License is the entire agreement between us, supercedes any other agreement or discussions, oral or 
written, and may not be changed except by a written signed agreement.  This License shall be governed 
and construed in accordance with the laws of Arizona, and by United States law on matters where 
Federal law provides the exclusive remedy.  If any provision of this License is declared by a Court of 
competent jurisdiction to be invalid, illegal, or unenforceable, such provision shall be severed from the 
License and the other provisions shall remain in full force and effect. 
 
Unpublished-rights reserved under the copyright laws of the United States. 
inData Corporation 225 E. Germann, Suite 310, Gilbert, Arizona 85297 
 
 


